HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE
CCG PURCH RFQ 2011-005

UNIFORMS
A & A Sales Associates SIZES [ ITEM#1 ] SIZES | ITEM#2| SIZES | [TEM#3 | SIZES ITEM#4 | SIZES | ITEM#5 | SIZES ITEM#6 | SIZES | ITEM#7 SIZES ITEM #8 SIZES ITEM;#l
Warringlon, Pannsyivania 18976 28 - 32 3 1450 1S-L 5 2475[S-L 5 1895 |5-L § 19.75|S-L H 625 |5-L § 2450]S-L $ 2210 }8-L 5 1185]S-1L 5 58.75
34 -38 $ 1450 XL $ 25.80 §XL § 20.25 IXL 5  21.00 [XL $ 6.25 XL §  25.00 |XL 5 2210 XL $ 1195 XL 60.40
40 - 46 5 14.50 J2XL $ 25.80 |2XL 3 21.25 |2XL $ 2250 |2xt 5 626 2XL $  25.50 |ZXL § 2350 [2XL § 1295 [2KL 6242
48 - 52 % 14.50 |3XL $ 2795 3xL $ 23.40 |3XL § 2400 |3XL §.25 |3XL $  26.50 [3XL 5 2475 |3XL §  13.95 |a3XL 5 67.99
4XE 5 20.05 [4XL $ 24.75 |4XL $  25.00 [4XL 7.25 14XL $  2B.00 [4XL 5 28.00 |4XL § 1495 J4XL 3 7475
5XL $ 30.50 [5XL $ 28.75 |5XL 5 29.00 |5XL 5 725 ]5XL §  29.00 |5XL $  29.00 |5XL $  16.75 |SXL $ 8490
SIZES [ITEM #10| SIZES [ITEM #11} SIZES |ITEM #12] SIZES | ITEM#13 | SIZES | TEM#14 | SIZES ITEM#15| SIZES | ITEM # 16 SIDE TEM# 17
S-L § 561015-L b 3240 )S-L $ 2975]8-L F: 2495 |S§-L § 2495|S-L 4776 {S-L E: 31.40
XL 56.10 | XL b 32.60 |XL 3 3015 XL 3 2505 XL $ 2596 [XL 47.75 |XL [ 31.40 ILEFT § 3.00
2XL 56.10 J2XL 34.50 |2XL 3§ 31.75 ML g 26.25 |2KL § 2625 |2XL §  47.75 JaXL § 3240
3XL 5 61.25 [3XL 5 37.25|8XL $ 3410 [3xL 27.40 |13XL $ 2740 |3XL 5 52.10 |3XL g 33.40 |RIGHT 3 3.25
4XL b 66.10 |4XL $ 4050 XL § 36.75 M4XL 28.25 |4XL $ 2825 |4XL $  53.75 |4XL § 3440
5XL NOBID [5XL $ 43.95 |5XL § 3990 igiL 29.95 |5XL 5 29,95 {8XL $  54.10 |5XL $ 3540
Hanover Uniform Company SIZES | MEM @1 | SIZES | TEM#2 | SIZES | ITEM #3I_SIZES TTEM#4 | SIZES | TEM#5 | SIZES | MEM#E | SIZES TTEM # 7 SIZES ITEM #8 | SIZES ITEM #9
Ballimore, Maryland 21211 28 - 32 § 1475(5-L $ 30.00|S-L $ 17.25]5-L §  10.95|5-L % 12.05]8-L $ 2850]5-L § 1150[8-L § 1575]5-L $ 3120
34 - 38 14.75 |XL $ 30.00 |XL B 17.25 XL b 19.95 |XL § 1205 XL 5 28.50 [XL E $4.50 XL $ 1575 XL 31.20
40 - 46 16.85 |2XL § 32.25 |2XL $ 19.25 [2XL b 23.35 {2XL 5 13.80 J2XL 5 2850 2XL E 13.15 |2XL 5  19.50 |2XL 33.60
48 - 52 $ 16.85 [aXL $ 3375 [AXL §_22.25 |3XL b 23.35 13XL 15.55 |3XL § 3105 )3xXL 13.15 [3XL 5  19.50 |3XL 36.00
4XL $ 3525 [4XL $ 22.80 |4XL b 23.35 JAXL 17.30 {4XL N/A J4XL § 1315 J4XL $  19.50 J4XL 3840
5XL $ 37.50 |5XL % 24.80 |5XL 3 23.35 [5XL 19.05 |5XL N/A [SXL $ 1595 |5XL $ 2375 I5XL 40.80
SIZES |IEM #10] SIZES JITEM #11] SIZES |IEM #12] SIZES | MEM4 13 | SIZES | MEME14 ] SLZES | TEM#16 | SIZES ITEM # 16 SIDE ITEM # 17
S-L $ 6015]S-L 60.00]S-L 3325 S-L 492015 -L § 3765]5-L 547518 - L 33.40
XL $ 80.15 XL £0.00 [XL 33.25 |XL 49.20 |XL $ 3765 XL 54.75 |XL 3.40 ILEFT ] 2.00
2XL $ 80.15 [2XL 60.00 J2XL 33.25 [2XL 49.20 12XL $ 3765 |2xL 54,75 |2XL 5.85
XL $ 7575 [aXL 66.00 JaxXL 36.30 [3XL 53.85 JaXL $  41.10 |aXL 60.25 |3XL 7.15 |RIGHT 3 1.00
4XL $ 8235 [4XL 66.00 |4XL 36.30 [4XL § 54 I4XL $ 57.10 [4XL §  60.25 [4XL $ 38.685
5XL 5§ 82,35 |sxL 66,00 |5XL 36.30 |5XL $  59.00 [5XL $ 5710 lﬁL 50.25 |SXL $ 40,15
Howard Uniform Company I_SIZES ITEM#1 | SIZES | MEM#2 | SIZES | ITEM#3 | SLZES TTEM#4 | SIZES | MEM#S I SIZES | MEM#8 | SIZES | ITEM#7 SIZES TTEM 58 ] SIZES [TEM f8
Ballimore, Mardand 21230 28 - 32 $ 1660[5-L § 2085|5-L $ 2350 |S-L $ 25.10i§-L 3 B.20]5-L § 3200|S-L $ 1800]S-L $  2000|S-L $ 51.65
34 - 38 $ 16.60 [XL 30.85 [XL § 23.50 XL § 2510 KL $ 0.20 |XL 32.00 |XL 5 1800 IXL $ 20,00 [XL 5 51.65
40 - 46 $ 16,80 [2XL 42,50 J2XL $ 26.20 [2XL §_ 28.10 J2XL $ 10.60 J2XL 32,00 |2XL § _ 18.75 |2XL $  22.70 |2XL 54,32
48 - 52 § 19.00 [3XL 45.20 3%L 26,20 [3XL §  28.10 |3XL 5 12.05 XL 34,25 [3XL 5 .76 JAXL NO BID__J3XL 57.00
[4xL 47.85 4L 26,20 [4XL $  28.10 JAXL 5 13.50 4XL NO BID _ [4XL ] .75 [4XL NO BID |4XL 60.00
[5XL 5 50.50 |5)L 35.00 J5XL NO BID  ]5XL $ 14.80 |5XL NO BID  |5XL §  31.00 |5XL NO BID  I5AL £3.00
SIZES JITEM #10] SIZES |ITEM #11] SIZES |ITEM #12] SIZE ITEM#13 | SIZE MEM M4 | SIZES | ITEM#15 ] SIZES H'EM_# 16 SIDE ITEM # 17
S-L 6810 |S - L S 3Meois-L $ 202008-L 48.75 S -L $ 474518-L $§ 48.70S-L § 43.65 ]
XL 68.10 XL $ 31.90 |XL $ 20.20 XL 48,75 |XL 3 47.45 IXL 3 48.70 |XL 43.65 |LEFT ] .50
2XL 74.00 |2XL 34.50 [2XL § 22.70 |20XL 56.75 |2XL §  55.00 f2XL E 48.70 [2XL 4635
3IXL 74,00 |3XL 37.20 JaXL $ 25.60 [3XL 56.75 |3XL §  55.00 JaXL E 53,50 |3XL 49.00 |RIGHT $ 3.50
4XL $ 80.00 [4XL 40.20 [4XL $ 27.90 |4XL § 62.50 [4XL $  55.00 J4XL § 53.50 [4XL 3 51.70
5XL NO BID  [SXL 3 43.20 |5XL § 30.50 |5XL $  62.50 [SXL § 6080 |5XL $ 53,50 [SXL $ 5435
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Imagewear Inlermalional _SIZES IMEM#1 | SIZES | ITEM #2 | SLZES ITEMUS' SIZES TEM #4 | 5IZES | ITEM#5 | SIZES | ITEM#6 | SIZES | [TEM#¥7 | SIZES ITEM #8 SIZES rTEM__
MNew Kenginglon, Pennsylvama 15068 |28 - 32 14855 -L $ 3500[S-L $ 1300[S-L $  2200]5-L § 1200]8-L % 1500{5-L $ 1450]s-L $ 1500]5-L & 5500
34 -38 $ 14.85 XL 35.00 XL $ 13.00 |XL 5 2200 XL §  12.00 {XL $  15.00 [XL 3 4.50 [XL $ 1500 IXL $ 55.00
40 - 46 $ 14.85 |2XL 37.00 J2XL 5 14.00 |2XL 5 23.00 |2XL $  13.00 |2XL S 17.00 [2XL 3 5.50 J2XL $  17.00 [ZXL S 58.00
48 - 52 $ 1605 [aXL 38.00 |3XL 15,00 J3XL $  24.00 [3xL $  14.00 [3XL 3 18.00 |3XL 3 7.00 J3XL §  18.00 |aXL § 60.00
4XL 3 39.00 J4XL 18,00 J4XL $ 2500 |4XL §  15.00 XL §  19.00 J4XL $  18.00 J4XL $  15.00 J4XL 5 62.00
I5¥XL $ 40.00 |SXL 17.00 |5XL. $  26.00 [5XL § 16.00 I57(L §  20.00 |sXL % 19.00 |SXL $ 20,00 |SXL § 64.00
SIZES [ITEM #10] SIZES |[ITEM #11] SIZES |ITEM#12] SIZES ITEM#13I SIZES | MEM#94 | SIZES | TEM#15] SIZES | MEMR 18 SIDE ITEM ¥ 17
S-L 81.00|S-L § 18.0015-L 5 1500 [8-L $ 4500]S-L 4000 ]S-L § 4BO0]S-L § 3500
XL 61,00 |XL 5 18.00 XL $ 15.00 |XL 5 45.00 XL 40.00 |XL § 48.00 IXL $ 53500 |LEFT 5 2.00
2X1 64,00 |2XL $ 21.00 |2XL $ 17.00 J2XL 5 47.00 |2XL ] 12.00@ $  50.00 J2XL § 37.00
XL 68,00 |3XL $ 21.00 |3XL S 17.00 |3XL §  47.00 |]axXL 5 42.00 JaXL $  50.00 JaXL §  39.00 [RIGHT $ 2.00
4XL 88,00 |4XL 3 23.00 MXL S 19.00 [4XL §  40.00 J4XL 5 45.00 J4XL $ 5500 [4xL $  41.00
SXL 6B.00 |5XL 5 23.00 |5XL 5 19.00 [5XL §  49.00 |SXL $ 4500 [SXL $  55.00 |5XL 5 41.00
M & P Associates, inc. SIZES ITI?! ¥ ] SIZES [IMTEM#2] SWZES | ITEM#3 IZES | ITEM#4 | SIZES | ITEM#S | SIZES | ITEM#ME IZES | MEM#7 SIZES ITEM #8 SIZES TTEM #9
Wilmington, Delaware 19803 28 - 32 $ 2025[5-L $ 3200]5-L § 17.35]s-L 5 2413)5-L § 2175[]S8-L $ 2955[S-L $ 2046]S-L 3300S-L $ 33.00
34 -38 § 20.23 [XL $ 3200 § 17.35 [XL F 2413 XL $ 2175 XL $ 2055 IXL § 20.46 XL 5  3300]XL 33,00
40 - 46 $ 23.59 |2XL 41.80 J2XL 5 21.26 |2xL 25.08 J2XL 23.85 [2XL [ 30.82 |2XL $  21.89 [aXL [: 34.00 [2XL 35.00
48 - 52 $ 25.00 [3XL 43.00 J3XL 5§ 2256 [aXL 268,13 [3XL 24.99 J3XL [ 31.85 [IXL E 22.85 [axL f 35.00 |3XL 35.00
4%L 45.00 J4XL 5 23.35 [4XL 32.88 J4XL 26.25 [4XL 5 32.50 J4XL $ 24,00 |4XL [ 36.00 j4XL 36.00
BXL 48.00 |5XL $ 24,35 |5XL 346.00 |5XL 28.00 |sXL §  34.00 |5XL $  26.50 |5XL $  Ir5018AL § 37.80
| SIZES |WEM ¢10] SIZES |ITEM #11] SIZES [ITEM #12] SIZES | MEM £13 | SIZES | ITEM #14 IZES lTEMﬂ15I SIZES | ITEM# 18 SIDE ITEM & 17
IS-L 71.50 |S - L 5 4600]S-L $ 2800f5-L 64,00 |S L § 4340|S-L § 56.00]S-L 40,50
XL 71.50 XL 45,00 |XL 26.00 XL 64,00 XL §$ 4340 XL $  56.00 [XL 40.50 |LEFT 3 4.00
2XL 72.98 J2¥L 44,00 [2XL 26.00 J2XL 56.23 [2XL & 44.85 |2XL § 57.88 [2XL 42,25
3IXL 74.90 13XL 40,52 [3XL 30.52 JaXL 68,23 JaXL $ 46.89 JaXL $  59.88 [3XL 43,68 [RIGHT s 4,00
4XL 75.89 J4¥L 50,35 J4XL 32.00 J4XL 70.33 JaXL §  48.00 [4XL $  60.98 XL $ 46,00
SXL $ 7690 |8XL 52,23 |5XL 34.00 |SXL 72,50 ]'SXL $ 5250 [SXL $ 63.89 iSJ(L $ 47.99




