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DIRECT
Acclaimed Promotions SIZES| ITEM #£1 | SIZES | ITEM # 2| SIZES|ITEM # 3 | SIZES | ITEM # 4 | EMBROIDERY
Owings Mills, Maryland 21117 L No Bid L NoBid |L NoBid |L No Bid No Bid
XL No Bid XL No Bid XL No Bid XL No Bid |No Bid
2XL {No Bid 2XL [NoBid |2XL |NoBid |2XL [NoBid |No Bid
3XL  |No Bid 3XL |NoBid |3XL |[NoBid |3XL |[NoBid [NoBid
4XL No Bid 4XL No Bid 4XL No Bid No Bid
5XL No Bid SXL No Bid
DIRECT
Ad-Wear and Specialty of Texas SIZES| ITEM #1 | SIZES | ITEM # 2| SIZES | ITEM # 3| SIZES| ITEM # 4 | EMBROIDERY
Houston, Texas 77063 L $ 18.36|L $ 1841 |L $ 18.41 L $ 26409 -
XL $ 18.36 |XL $ 18.41 |XL $ 18.41 XL $ 2640 | % -
2XL $ 2086 |2XL $ 19.41 |2XL $ 20.16 |2XL $ 2740| % -
3XL $ 21.86 |3XL $ 21.41 |3XL $ 21.91 |3XL $ 2040 | % -
4XL S 22.86 j4XL S 22.41 4XL S 3040(5 =
5XL $ 24.36 [5XL N/A S -
DIRECT
Carolina Industrial Mat Co., Inc. SIZES| ITEM #1 | SIZES| ITEM # 2| SIZES | ITEM # 3| SIZES | ITEM # 4| EMBROIDERY
Thomasville, North Carolina 27360 |L $ 19.90|L $ 2099 |L NoBid |L No Bid $ -
XL $ 1899 |XL $ 2099 [XL No Bid |XL No Bid $ -
2XL $ 2099 |2XL $ 2199 |2XL |NoBid |2XL |No Bid $ -
3XL [$ 2199 [3XL |$ 2299 |3XL |NoBid [3XL |NoBid |[§ -
AXL S 22.99 [4XL S 23.99 4xL No Bid S =
5XL $ 23.99 [5XL $ 24.99 S -
DIRECT
Global Products, Inc. SIZES| ITEM #1 | SIZES| ITEM # 2| SIZES| ITEM # 3| SIZES | ITEM # 4| EMBROIDERY
Earth City, Missouri 63045 L $ 725|L $ 1290 |L $ 980|L $ 3025(% 0.67
XL $ 725X $ 1290 [XL $ 9.80 XL $ 3025|% 0.69
2XL $ 925 |2XL $ 1490 |2XL $ 11.80 |2XL $ 3225|% 0.69
3XL $ 10.25|3XL $ 16.90 [3XL |NoBid [3XL $ 3425(% 0.72
4XL S 11.25 |4XL No Bid 4XL No Bid S 0.73
5XL No Bid 5XL No Bid S 60.00
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DIRECT
Marked Promotions SIZES| ITEM # 1 | SIZES| ITEM # 2| SIZES | ITEM # 3| SIZES | ITEM # 4| EMBROIDERY
Landover, Maryland 20785 L $ 18.66 |L $ 18.84{L $ 16.58 |L $ 26279 1.50
XL $ 18.66 |XL $ 18.84 |XL $ 16.58 XL $ 2627 |9 1.98
2XL $ 20.46 |2XL $ 20.64 |2XL $ 18.68 |2XL $ 2748 | % 2
3XL $ 21.66 [3XL $ 21.84 [3XL $ 20.78 |3XL $ 2988 (% =
axL | $ 22.86|4XL | $ 23.04 4XL | $ 31.08 |5 -
5XL S 24.66 [5XL S 24.84 S -
DIRECT
Screen Design & Promotions SIZES| ITEM # 1 | SIZES| ITEM # 2| SIZES | ITEM # 3| SIZES| ITEM # 4 | EMBROIDERY
Davidsonville, Maryland 21035 L $ 1721 |L $ 2200 |L $ 1764 |L $ 2013 | % o
XL $ 17.21 |XL $ 22.00 |XL $ 1764 |XL $ 2013 |9 =
2XL $ 2236 |2XL $ 2414 12XL $ 2014 |2XL $ 3056 (% -
3XL $ 2314 |3XL $ 2557 |3XL $ 2264 |3XL $ 3341 (% -
aXL S 25.21 14XL S 27.00 4XL S 3484158 -
5XL S 27.43 |5XL S 29.14 S 50.00
DIRECT
Wind Whisper Products, Inc. SIZES| ITEM #1 | SIZES| ITEM # 2| SIZES| ITEM # 3| SIZES | ITEM # 4| EMBROIDERY
Grasonville, Maryland 21638 L $ 2461|L $ 2818 |L $ 2691 |L $ 4343 |% -
XL $ 2461 |XL $ 2818 XL $ 26.91 XL $ 4343 % -
2XL $ 29.70 |2XL $ 30.25 |2XL $ 29.59 |2XL $ 4563 |9 =
3XL $ 33.00 [3XL $ 32.45 13XL $ 33.44 |3XL $ 50031% =
AXL S 36.45 |4XL $ 34.65 4XL $ 5223 |6 -
5XL S 41.47 |5XL S 36.85 S 75.00




