SOLID WASTE

CCG PURCH RFQ 2011-039
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS
VENDOR TABLE | LWTER DENIM CURRENCYF SILICONE EARTH DAY BIRD SPONGES| ZIPPER | RULERS JAR ADD. TOTAL
et edihli e —_—
COVER BAGS FENCILS | PENCILS | WRISTBANDS | WRISTBANDS | FEEDERS PULLS OPENERS FEES
Aricrafi Ad Speciallies NOBID | NOBID |$ 45750 § 457.50| 83500 $ 35000 | $1,06000| 5 906.00 | NOBID [ NOBID | § 217.00 § 4,283.00
University Park, FL 34201
Acclaimed Promotions %23000[ $ 43000 % 675003 675.00| § 105000 | § 420.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $1,065.00 | $175.00 $300.00 [ § 275.00 § 6,704.00
Owings Mills, Maryland 21117
Bruce D. Sechrisl NOBID { $§ 200.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | § 20000|% 10000]3% 680.00
Jessup, Maryland 20794
Compelitive Edge $19147] $ 24500| $ 52250 | % 59000 § 1,24000 | $ 20600 S 1.170.00 | $1.006.50 [ $193.00  $250.75 | $  245.50 $ 6,159.72
Des Moines, lowa 50322
Focus Communications $323.38 [ § 880.00( $1,150.00( 5 1,150.00 | $ 187500 | & 750.00 1 § 1.875.00 | $1.860.00 [ OUT OF | $37200 | § 320.00 $10,555.28
Severna Park, Maryland 21146 STOCK
Proforma Capital Graphics $22100] § 32000|§ 57500(5 57500 % 2,100.00| 35 B40.00 | § 1,345.00 | $1,155.00 | $240.00 | §320.00 | $ 245.00 $ 7,936.00
Mt. Airy, Manyland 21771
Prime Plus Promolional Producls NOBID[$ 72000| % 775008 1,225.00| % 850.00 NO BID $2.140.00 | $2.850.00 | NOBID | $387.50 | $ 375.00 $ 9,322.50
Bowie, Maryland 20721
Slaples $33100[ $ 36000 | § 60000 (S 600007 % 2,150.00 | % 04000 | $1,360.00 | $1,245.00 | $167.50 | $17250 | $ 710.00 $ 8,636.00
Hanover, Mandand 21076




